



SEALED PROPOSALS RECEIVED IN THE DIVISION OF PURCHASES & SUPPLIES
For Sewage Sludge Cake Disposal & Transport Services
 PROPOSAL# 21000605

Approximate Annual Quantities – Not Guaranteed
 Furnish as requested for the period 7/1/20 – 6/30/21

Biosolids (Landfill) Disposal Contract

BID FORM

Bidder #1: DHT Transport
 2695 W. Vassar Rd., Reese, MI 48757

Landfill (Sludge Disposal) Hours of Operation		YEAR 1 7/1/21 to 6/30/22	YEAR 2 7/1/22 to 6/30/23	YEAR 3 7/1/23 to 6/30/24
		Total cost per ton	Total cost per ton	Total cost per ton
Monday thru Friday		\$ No Bid	\$ No Bid	\$ No Bid
Saturday		\$ No Bid	\$ No Bid	\$ No Bid
Holidays		\$ No Bid	\$ No Bid	\$ No Bid
TOTAL COST 13,000 Tons per fiscal year		\$ No Bid	\$ No Bid	\$ No Bid

A SPECIAL NOTE FROM THE PURCHASING DIVISION

Bid results posted are before evaluation team review and award recommendation.



Biosolids Transportation Contract
YEAR 1 BID FORM
July 1, 2021 to June 30, 2022

LANDFILL	Republic Citizens Grand Blanc	Brent Run Montrose	Venice Park Lennon	Waste Management Birch Run
LOCATION	2361 W Grand Blanc RD Grand Blanc MI 48439	8335 Vienna RD Montrose MI 48457	9536 E Lennon RD Lennon MI 48449	4143 East Rathbun RD Birch Run, MI 48415
DISTANCE, Miles Travel Time	10.2 12 minutes	15.0 17 minutes	13.8 19 minutes	21.3 29 minutes
Cost per ton, per mile General rate	Cost per ton Trailer			
\$ N/A	\$ 455.00	\$ 455.00	\$ 455.00	\$ 500.00

Biosolids Transportation Contract
YEAR 2 BID FORM
July 1, 2022 to June 30, 2023

LANDFILL	Republic Citizens Grand Blanc	Brent Run Montrose	Venice Park Lennon	Waste Management Birch Run
LOCATION	2361 W Grand Blanc RD Grand Blanc MI 48439	8335 Vienna RD Montrose MI 48457	9536 E Lennon RD Lennon MI 48449	4143 East Rathbun RD Birch Run, MI 48415
DISTANCE, Miles Travel Time	10.2 12 minutes	15.0 17 minutes	13.8 19 minutes	21.3 29 minutes
Cost per ton, per mile General rate	Cost per ton Trailer			
\$ N/A	\$ 466.38	\$ 466.38	\$ 466.38	\$ 512.50

A SPECIAL NOTE FROM THE PURCHASING DIVISION

Bid results posted are before evaluation team review and award recommendation.



Biosolids Transportation Contract YEAR 3 BID FORM

July 1, 2023 to June 30, 2024

LANDFILL	Republic Citizens Grand Blanc	Brent Run Montrose	Venice Park Lennon	Waste Management Birch Run
LOCATION	2361 W Grand Blanc RD Grand Blanc MI 48439	8335 Vienna RD Montrose MI 48457	9536 E Lennon RD Lennon MI 48449	4143 East Rathbun RD Birch Run, MI 48415
DISTANCE, Miles Travel Time	10.2 12 minutes	15.0 17 minutes	13.8 19 minutes	21.3 29 minutes
Cost per ton, per mile General rate	Cost per ton Trailer			
\$ N/A	\$ 478.04	\$ 478.04	\$ 478.04	\$ 525.31

A SPECIAL NOTE FROM THE PURCHASING DIVISION

Bid results posted are before evaluation team review and award recommendation.



Biosolids (Landfill) Disposal Contract

BID FORM

Bidder #2: Republic Services of Flint
4101 Holiday Drive, Flint, MI 48507

Landfill (Sludge Disposal) Hours of Operation		YEAR 1 7/1/21 to 6/30/22	YEAR 2 7/1/22 to 6/30/23	YEAR 3 7/1/23 to 6/30/24
		Total cost per ton	Total cost per ton	Total cost per ton
Monday thru Friday		\$ 19.00 per ton	\$ 20.00 per ton	\$ 21.00 per ton
Saturday		\$ 19.00 per ton	\$ 20.00 per ton	\$ 21.00 per ton
Holidays		\$ 30.00 per ton	\$ 32.00 per ton	\$ 33.00 per ton
TOTAL COST 13,000 Tons per fiscal year		\$ 247,000.00	\$ 260,000.00	\$ 273,000.00

A SPECIAL NOTE FROM THE PURCHASING DIVISION

Bid results posted are before evaluation team review and award recommendation.



Biosolids Transportation Contract
YEAR 1 BID FORM
July 1, 2021 to June 30, 2022

LANDFILL	Republic Citizens Grand Blanc	Brent Run Montrose	Venice Park Lennon	Waste Management Birch Run
LOCATION	2361 W Grand Blanc RD Grand Blanc MI 48439	8335 Vienna RD Montrose MI 48457	9536 E Lennon RD Lennon MI 48449	4143 East Rathbun RD Birch Run, MI 48415
DISTANCE, Miles Travel Time	10.2 12 minutes	15.0 17 minutes	13.8 19 minutes	21.3 29 minutes
Cost per ton, per mile General rate	Cost per ton Trailer			
\$	\$475.00 per trailer load	\$	\$	\$

Biosolids Transportation Contract
YEAR 2 BID FORM
July 1, 2022 to June 30, 2023

LANDFILL	Republic Citizens Grand Blanc	Brent Run Montrose	Venice Park Lennon	Waste Management Birch Run
LOCATION	2361 W Grand Blanc RD Grand Blanc MI 48439	8335 Vienna RD Montrose MI 48457	9536 E Lennon RD Lennon MI 48449	4143 East Rathbun RD Birch Run, MI 48415
DISTANCE, Miles Travel Time	10.2 12 minutes	15.0 17 minutes	13.8 19 minutes	21.3 29 minutes
Cost per ton, per mile General rate	Cost per ton Trailer			
\$	\$490.00 per trailer load	\$	\$	\$

A SPECIAL NOTE FROM THE PURCHASING DIVISION

Bid results posted are before evaluation team review and award recommendation.



Biosolids Transportation Contract YEAR 3 BID FORM

July 1, 2023 to June 30, 2024

LANDFILL	Republic Citizens Grand Blanc	Brent Run Montrose	Venice Park Lennon	Waste Management Birch Run
LOCATION	2361 W Grand Blanc RD Grand Blanc MI 48439	8335 Vienna RD Montrose MI 48457	9536 E Lennon RD Lennon MI 48449	4143 East Rathbun RD Birch Run, MI 48415
DISTANCE, Miles Travel Time	10.2 12 minutes	15.0 17 minutes	13.8 19 minutes	21.3 29 minutes
Cost per ton, per mile General rate	Cost per ton Trailer			
\$	\$500.00 per trailer load	\$	\$	\$

A SPECIAL NOTE FROM THE PURCHASING DIVISION

Bid results posted are before evaluation team review and award recommendation.



Biosolids (Landfill) Disposal Contract

BID FORM

Bidder #3: Waste Management of Michigan, Inc.
4143 East Rathbun Rd., Birch Run, MI 48415

Landfill (Sludge Disposal) Hours of Operation		YEAR 1 7/1/21 to 6/30/22	YEAR 2 7/1/22 to 6/30/23	YEAR 3 7/1/23 to 6/30/24
		Total cost per ton	Total cost per ton	Total cost per ton
Monday thru Friday		\$ 38.50	\$ 40.40	\$ 42.43
Saturday		Closed	Closed	Closed
Holidays		Closed	Closed	Closed
TOTAL COST 13,000 Tons per fiscal year		\$ 500,000.00	\$ 525,200.00	\$ 551,590.00

A SPECIAL NOTE FROM THE PURCHASING DIVISION

Bid results posted are before evaluation team review and award recommendation.



Biosolids Transportation Contract
YEAR 1 BID FORM
July 1, 2021 to June 30, 2022

LANDFILL	Republic Citizens Grand Blanc	Brent Run Montrose	Venice Park Lennon	Waste Management Birch Run
LOCATION	2361 W Grand Blanc RD Grand Blanc MI 48439	8335 Vienna RD Montrose MI 48457	9536 E Lennon RD Lennon MI 48449	4143 East Rathbun RD Birch Run, MI 48415
DISTANCE, Miles Travel Time	10.2 12 minutes	15.0 17 minutes	13.8 19 minutes	21.3 29 minutes
Cost per ton, per mile General rate	Cost per ton			
\$	\$ No Bid	\$ No Bid	\$ No Bid	\$ No Bid

Biosolids Transportation Contract
YEAR 2 BID FORM
July 1, 2022 to June 30, 2023

LANDFILL	Republic Citizens Grand Blanc	Brent Run Montrose	Venice Park Lennon	Waste Management Birch Run
LOCATION	2361 W Grand Blanc RD Grand Blanc MI 48439	8335 Vienna RD Montrose MI 48457	9536 E Lennon RD Lennon MI 48449	4143 East Rathbun RD Birch Run, MI 48415
DISTANCE, Miles Travel Time	10.2 12 minutes	15.0 17 minutes	13.8 19 minutes	21.3 29 minutes
Cost per ton, per mile General rate	Cost per ton			
\$	\$ No Bid	\$ No Bid	\$ No Bid	\$ No Bid

A SPECIAL NOTE FROM THE PURCHASING DIVISION

Bid results posted are before evaluation team review and award recommendation.



Biosolids Transportation Contract YEAR 3 BID FORM

July 1, 2023 to June 30, 2024

LANDFILL	Republic Citizens Grand Blanc	Brent Run Montrose	Venice Park Lennon	Waste Management Birch Run
LOCATION	2361 W Grand Blanc RD Grand Blanc MI 48439	8335 Vienna RD Montrose MI 48457	9536 E Lennon RD Lennon MI 48449	4143 East Rathbun RD Birch Run, MI 48415
DISTANCE , Miles Travel Time	10.2 12 minutes	15.0 17 minutes	13.8 19 minutes	21.3 29 minutes
Cost per ton, per mile General rate	Cost per ton			
\$	\$ No Bid	\$ No Bid	\$ No Bid	\$ No Bid

A SPECIAL NOTE FROM THE PURCHASING DIVISION

Bid results posted are before evaluation team review and award recommendation.