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ROLL CALL

RESOLUTIONS

170427 Multi-Year/Contract/A.S.K. Services, Inc/Title Searches

Resolution authorizing the proper city officials, upon City Council approval, to enter
into a contract for three years with A.S.K. Services, Inc. for title searches, as
requested by Development, in an amount NOT-TO-EXCEED $50,000.00 annually,
pending adoption of the FY2019 and FY2020 budgets [Grants FHUD17CDBG
Fund Acct. No. 274-748.140-800.000].

170428 Multi-Year/Hach Company/Hach Laboratory Supplies

Resolution authorizing the Department of Purchases & Supplies, upon City
Council’s approval, is to issue annual purchase orders to Hach Company for Hach
laboratory supplies, as requested by Utilities/Water Plant/Water Pollution Control,
in an amount NOT-TO-EXCEED $34,400.00 annually, pending adoption of the
FY2019 and FY2020 budgets [Sewer Fund Acct. No. 590-550.100-740.200 =

$4,400.00 and Water Fund Acct. No. 591-545.200-726.000 = $30,000.00].

170429 Multi-YearIVWR Scientific/Laboratory Supplies

Resolution authorizing the Department of Purchases & Supplies, upon City Council
approval, to issue purchase orders to VWR Scientific for a three-year period for
laboratory supplies, as requested by Utilities, in an amount NOT-TO-EXCEED
$58,000.00 [Sewer Fund Acct. No. 590-550.100-740.200 = $18,000.00 and Water
Fund Acct. No. 591-545.200-726.000 = $40,000.00]

OLD, OUTSTANDING DISCUSSION ITEMS

170056 Referral/Status/Revolving Loan Fund

Referral by Councilperson Poplar to ADMIN/PLANNING and DEVELOPMENT, re:
She would like the status of the revolving loan fund for 2016 - who got them, what
they were for, how much they received and how much they owe. [Referral Action
Date: 1/18/2017 © Finance Committee Meeting)

170057 Referral/Status/Grants

Referral byCouncilperson PoplartoADMIN/PLANNING and DEVELOPMENT, re:
She would like the status of all grants received by Planning & Development for
2016- amount, who got them and what they were for. [Referral Action Date:
1/18/2017 © Finance Committee Meeting]

170059 Referral/RFP/Street Restoration
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Referral by Councilperson Fields to ADMIN/FINANCE, re: She would like to see
the separate RFP for road restoration after pipe replacement. [Referral Action
Date: 1/18/2017 @ Finance Committee Meeting]

170061 Referral/Copy/Public Relations Contract

Referral by Councilperson Fields to ADMIN/LEGAL, re: She would like a copy of
the public relations contract that was entered into with pipe replacement funding.
[Referral Action Date: 1/18/2017 © Finance Committee Meeting]

170066 Referral/Business Customers/Legal Action/Multi-Unit Developments

Referral by Councilperson Mays to ADMIN/LEGAL, re: He would like the law
department to provide information on how to pursue action against owners of
multi-unit developments when the renters pay their water bills but the landlord does
not, and if that can be written into an ordinance. [Referral Action Date: 1/18/2017
@ Finance Committee Meeting]

170139 Referral/Protoqol for Grants

Referral by Councilperson Mays to CITY CLERK: re: He asks for the written
protocol on grants (what has to be approved by council). [Referral Action Date:
3/8/2017 @ Finance Committee Meeting]

170387 Hydrovacs/Fast Start Program

Referral by Councilperson Mays to MAYOR/ADM/: He asks that the city purchase
two more hydrovacs for use in the Fast Start Program. [Referral Action Date:
7/6/2017 @ Finance Committee Meeting.]

170388 Discussion Item/Ward Accounts

Discussion item from Councilperson Mays: He would like a discussion of ward
accounts on the next Finance Committee Meeting agenda. [Referral Action Date:
7/6/2017 © Finance Committee Meeting.]

170389 Discussion Item/Police Finances

Discussion item from Councilperson Mays: He would like a discussion of police
finances on the next Finance Committee Meeting agenda. [Referral Action Date:
7/6/2017 © Finance Committee Meeting.]

170390 Discussion Item/State of Michigan Reimbursements

Discussion item from Councilperson Mays: He would like a discussion item about
State of Michigan reimbursements to other city departments on the next Finance
Committee Meeting agenda. [Referral Action Date: 7/6/2017 @ Finance Committee
Meeting.]
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ADJOURNMENT
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