South

Atomic 3-D W.T. Seymour
Property Name Acres|Location/Description Grounds IMA J&M | AA Lawn| Norfleet |Lawncare| Beck's Stevens | & Sons
Beecher Triangle 0.5 |Traingle at Beecher and Ballenge| $  25.00| nobid | $ 18.00 | $ 19.00 nobid | $ 40.00|$ 9.00| Nobid | $ 25.00
FCTOTTTTC TS T TGS
0.1 _ $ 1500|$ 20.00|$ 18.00|$ 17.00| nobid $ 20.00 | $ 7.00| Nobid |$ 15.00
McKinley Park Pgrk area at Colllr_lgwood anc_i
Pier, north to ballfield, excluding
8 |wooded area $ 145.00 | $169.00 | $144.00 | $149.00 | $ 200.00 | $240.00 | $ 134.00| $160.00 | $ 240.00
Cummings Park Small park area along Orville St
4 $ 8500|% 64.00| % 72.00|$ 79.00 | $ 150.00 | $ 130.00 | $ 59.00 | $ 80.00 | $ 120.00
Mobley Park Miller and Court Street (divided
2 |by residential St) $ 3500|% 4400| % 36.00|$ 4800($ 75.00| $ 70.00 | $ 29.00 | $ 80.00 | $ 60.00
Small triangle at Hammerburg
Hammerburg Triangle and
0.2 [Miller Road. $ 20.00| nobid |$ 18.00|$ 19.00| no bid $ 20.00 | $ 7.00| Nobid |$ 15.00
Chicago Triangles (3) Barney, 1 at Knight, and one at
0.5 |Stocker $ 25.00| nobid |$ 1800| % 19.00| nobid |$ 35.00|$ 10.00 | Nobid |$ 15.00
parkland north of Thread Lake
Crocker Park and south of Lippincott running
from
4 |Maybury to Dwight $ 8500|% 69.00|$ 72.00|$ 79.00 | $ 100.00 | $130.00 | $ 58.00 | $ 80.00 | $ 120.00
Triangle at Victoria and Grand
Victoria Triangle Traverse
0.1 $ 20.00| nobid |$ 18.00|$ 17.00| nobid $ 20.00 | $ 7.00| Nobid |$ 15.00
Bagley and Chevrolet, Marquette
Mott Park Triangles (3) and Weller, Marquette and
0.75 |Dougherty $ 25.00| nobid $ 18.00 | $ 24.00 no bid $ 50.00 | $ 14.00 | Nobid |$ 25.00
Perry Street Triangles (2) Woodbridge and Perry, Cartier
0.75 |and Perry $ 25.00| nobid $ 18.00 | $ 24.00 no bid $ 50.00 | $ 14.00 | Nobid |$ 25.00
Cadillac Triangle Triangle at Cadillac and Dupont
0.1 $ 20.00| nobid |$ 18.00|$ 17.00| nobid $ 20.00 | $ 7.00| Nobid |$ 15.00
Linsey Blvd Median along Linsey from
1 |Saginaw Street to I-475 $ 20.00| nobid |$ 18.00|$ 24.00| nobid |$ 40.00 | $ 18.00 | Nobid |$ 30.00




Omega Triangle

Triangle at Ogema and Dell

0.1 _ _ 10.00| nobid |$ 18.00| $ 17.00 | no bid $ 20.00 7.00| Nobid |$ 15.00
Saginaw/Atherton Traingle at Saginaw and
0.1 10.00 | $ 20.00| $ 18.00| $ 17.00 | no bid $ 20.00 7.00| Nobid |$ 15.00
Park area at Farley and
Atherton East Park Chambers, excluding school
10 |property 180.00 | $ 168.00 | $ 180.00 | $189.00 | $ 200.00 | $ 375.00 150.00 | $200.00 | $ 300.00
Triangle at Atherton and
Atherton Triangle 0.1 |Vanslyke 10.00 | no bid $ 18.00| $ 17.00 no bid $ 20.00 7.00| Nobid |$ 15.00
Ramsey Triangle Triangle at Ramsey and Colfax
0.1 _ 15.00 | nobid | $ 18.00 | $ 17.00| nobid | $ 20.00 7.00 | Nobid |[$ 15.00
Dupont Blvd Flushing Rd
2 45.00| nobid [$ 36.00| $ 48.00| no bid $ 75.00 34.00| $ 80.00|$ 60.00
Chevrolet Ave Dupont
4 90.00 | nobid |$ 72.00|$ 79.00| nobid | $ 140.00 58.00 | $ 80.00 | $ 120.00
S. Saginaw St. Blvd Street
0.75 20.00 nobid | $ 18.00 | $ 24.00| no bid $ 60.00 14.00 | Nobid |$ 25.00




