Northwest

Atomic 3-D W.T. Seymour
Property Name Acres |Location/Description Grounds IMA J&M | AA Lawn Norfleet |[Lawncare| Beck's | Stevens | & Sons
Civic Park Triangles I'rangles at Hunbolt and Forest
0.25 |Hill, Jackson and Dartmouth $ 20.00| nobid |$ 18.00| $ 19.00 No bid $ 20.00|$ 7.00| Nobid |$ 15.00
Welch Blvd i
2 $ 45.00| nobid |$ 36.00] $ 48.00 No bid $ 65.00| $34.00|$ 80.00 | $ 60.00
TTIATgre dat VVEICTI, UITEVIUIET &
Welch Triangles (2) 0.1 |Stockdale, Traingle at Welch & $ 20.00| nobid |$ 18.00($ 17.00 No bid $ 2000 $ 7.00| Nobid |$ 15.00
Dayton Bivd IVIEUTAIT ITOTTT FOTEST HINT U PTOCTOT
2 $ 45.00| nobid |$ 36.00] $ 48.00 No bid $ 70.00 | $34.00|$ 80.00 | $ 60.00
Dayton Triangles (2) L
0.1 $ 20.00| nobid |$ 18.00| $ 17.00 No bid $ 2000 $ 7.00| Nobid |[$ 15.00
Small Park behind houses at
Dougherty Park Chevrolet, Paterson and
1 |Stockdale $ 25.00| nobid |$ 18.00 | $ 24.00 No bid $ 40.00| $18.00|$ 80.00 | $ 30.00
Chester Simmons Triangle Carge Tramgre/ivieararn at VL.
2 |King and Pierson Road $ 45.00| nobid |$ 36.00] $ 48.00 No bid $ 70.00 | $34.00|$ 80.00 | $ 60.00
2 Triangles at Dartmouth and
East Lawn Triangles (2) Lawndale
0.25 $ 20.00| nobid |$ 18.00| $ 19.00 No bid $ 2000 $ 7.00| Nobid |[$ 15.00
Forest Hill Bivd Median from Welch to Humbolt
2 $ 45.00| nobid |$ 36.00] $ 48.00 No bid $ 60.00 | $34.00|$ 80.00 | $ 60.00
Hamilton Blvd Median from Dupont to Forest Hill
3 $ 75.00| nobid |$ 4500 $ 59.00 No bid $ 100.00 | $50.00 | $ 80.00 | $ 90.00
Wilkens Park Parkland at Verdun and York,
1.7 |excluding school property $ 40.00| nobid [$3000(% 3900|$% 50.00(% 6500|%$2700|% 80.00($ 45.00
Triangle at Mackin, Dupont and
Mackin/Dupont Triangle Barth
0.1 $ 20.00| nobid |$ 18.00| $ 17.00 No bid $ 2000 $ 7.00| Nobid |[$ 15.00
Triangle at Francis, Paterson and
Della Triangle Oren
0.1 $ 20.00| nobid |$ 18.00| $ 17.00 No bid $ 2000 $ 7.00| Nobid |[$ 15.00
Oren Triangle (2) 2 Triangles at Oren and M.L. King
0.1 $ 20.00| nobid |$ 18.00| $ 17.00 No bid $ 2000 $ 7.00| Nobid |$ 15.00
Paterson Bivd Median from Forest Hill to Dupont
1 $ 20.00| nobid |$ 18.00 | $ 24.00 No bid $ 50.00[ $18.00|$ 80.00 | $ 15.00




Park at Saginaw, Dewey and

Dewey Park Moore, excluding Sylvester

4.5 [Broome Center $80.00| % 97.00| $ 81.00| $ 89.00 | $ 150.00 | $ 160.00 | $99.00 | $ 90.00 | $ 135.00
Chevrolet Bivd Median from Dayton to Mackin

4 $ 8500 nobid |$ 72.00| $ 79.00 No bid $ 150.00 | $68.00 | $ 80.00 | $ 120.00




