Various parks

Carey's 3-D

Property Name Acres Location/Description AAK lawn J&M AA Lawn Lawncare Rico Beck's SRB
Whaley Park 72 Located at Franklin Ave. & Utah Ave. $ 1,080.00 | § 800.00 | $ 1,080.00 1,140.00 | $ 1,152.00 5,760.00 1,080.00 699.00
Broome Park

79 Located near Tuxedo Ave. & Neubert Ave. $ 1,185.00 no bid $ 1,185.00 1,235.00 | $ 1,264.00 6,320.00 1,185.00 844.00
Kearsley Park

57 Located Kearsley Park Boulevard & Lewis Street. $ 855.00 no bid $ 855.00 902.50 | $ 912.00 4,275.00 855.00 674.00
Longway Park Located near Averill Ave. & Whittier Ave. (open areas

23 only) $ 345.00 no bid $ 345.00 380.00 | $ 368.00 1,725.00 340.00 284.00

Perimeter areas only — between the tree line and

Max Brandon Park 99 Dupont, M.L. King, Stewart and Pasadena $ 1,485.00 no bid $ 1,485.00 1,567.50 | $ 1,584.00 8,910.00 1,633.00 1,475.00
Mott Park 7.5 Located between Nolan, Marquette and Daugherty $ 112.50 | $ 100.00 | $ 135.00 95.00 | $ 250.00 225.00 100.00 90.00




