Northwest

United Ground No Mo Brantley
Property Name Acres [Location/Description Lawnscape | Control J&M Tears Dev.
Civic Park Triangles Triangles at Humbolt and Forest Hill,
0.25 |Jackson and Dartmouth $ 42.00] $ 550|$ 16.00($ 5.50 no bid
Welch Blvd Median from M. L. King to Forest Hill
2 $ 124.00($ 25.00|$% 3200 $ 24.50 no bid
Triangle at Welch, Chevrolet &
Welch Triangle (1) 0.5 |Stockdale, Traingle at Welch & Dupont || $ 42.00] $ 550|$ 16.00($ 5.75 no bid
Dayton Blvd Median from Forest Hill to Proctor
2 $ 124.00($ 25.00|$% 3200 $ 24.50 no bid
Dayton Triangles (2 2 Triangles at Delmar and Forest Hil
0.1 $ 42.00 | $ 550 (% 20.00|$ 5.75 no bid
Dougherty Park Small Park behind houses at Chevrolet,
1 Paterson and Stockdale $ 68.00|$ 10.00($ 25.00]| % 9.50 no bid
Chester Simmons Triangle Large Traingle/Median at M.L. King and
2 Pierson Road $ 124.00 no bid $ 3200 % 23.50 no bid
East Lawn Triangles (2) 2 Triangles at Dartmouth and Lawndale
0.25 $ 42.00 | $ 550 (% 19.00 | $ 5.50 no bid
Forest Hill Blvd Median from Welch to Humbolt
2 $ 124.00($ 25.00|$% 3200 $ 24.50 no bid
Hamilton Blvd Median from Dupont to Forest Hill
3 $ 186.00 | $ 35.00 | $§ 48.00 no bid 49.25
Wilkens Park Parkland at Verdun and York, excluding
1.7 |school property $ 105.00 no bid $ 3200 9% 19.50 no bid
Mackin/Dupont Triangle Triangle at Mackin, Dupont and Barth
0.1 $ 42.00 | $ 550 (% 20.00|$ 5.75 no bid
Della Triangle Triangle at Francis, Paterson and Oren
0.1 $ 42.00 | $ 550 (% 20.00|$ 5.75 no bid
Oren Triangle (2) 2 Triangles at Oren and M.L. King
0.1 $ 42.00 | $ 550 (% 20.00|$ 5.75 no bid
Median from Forest Hill to Dupont
Paterson Blvd 1 $ 68.00/$ 10.00|$% 20.00]|$ 9.50 no bid
North of Stewart, south of Pierson, east
of Fleming, west of Dupont. Mow
pavilion, docks, parkway, ballfields, etc. -
Flint Park Lake 20 |mow bi-weekly. $ 880.00 no bid $ 320.00 no bid 335.50
Chevrolet Blvc Median from Dayton to Mackir
4 $ 228.00 no bid $ 65.00 no bid 52.50
Triangle on Greenway and
Welch 0.5 |Mow bi-weekly $ 42.00 no bid $ 20.00 no bid no bid




