Central

United Ground No Mo Brantley
Property Name Acres |Location/Description Lawnscape | Control J&M | AALawn| Tears Dev. SRB L.A.F.
Stevenson/5th Triangle 0.25|Small triangle at Stevenson and 5th Ave.|| $ 42.00 | no bid $ 12.00 nobid [$ 5.75 | no bid no bid no bid
Saginaw/3rd Triangle Small triangle at Saginaw St. ¢
0.1 [3rd Ave $ 42.00| nobid |$ 1200| nobid |[$ 3.75 no bid no bid no bid
Saginaw/King Triangle Small triangle at Saginaw St. ¢
0.1 |M.L.King Ave. $ 4200|$ 550|% 1200| nobid [$ 3.75 no bid no bid no bid
8th and 9th Street 2 corner Properties at 8th & 9th St.
corners & Triangles at Saginaw, triangle at 9th & Church,
2-triangles at 9th & Beach, triangle at
0.75 |9th St. & Grand Traverse $ 51.00| nobid [$ 12.00| nobid |$ 9.50 no bid no bid $ 10.00
Gateway Triangles (3 triangle at E. Court and 5th S
(Gateway Sign), 2 triangles at
2 Lapeer & 5th St. $ 124.00|$ 25.00|$ 29.00| nobid |[$ 24.50 no bid no bid no bid
East Street Blvc Linear Park running from E. Court S
1.4 [to north of Second Street. $ 87.00|$ 17.00($ 20.00| nobid |$ 16.50 no bid no bid no bid
Brookside Dr., property up to the senio
center (includes tennis courts and soccef
Pierce Park 8 field) - not the golf course $ 416.00| nobid | $ 128.00| $ 151.00( nobid | $ 13250 $ 90.00 no bid
Atwood Stadiunr Parkway outside of Atwood Stadiur
1 at 3rd Ave and Begole $ 68.00| nobid [$ 16.00| nobid |$ 9.50 no bid no bid no bid
Commonwealtt Triangle at Commonwealth &
Triangles (3) Montclair, triangle at Commonwealth
& Glendale, triangle at Greenfield &
1.5 [Commonwealth $ 93.00| nobid [$ 2500| nobid |$ 19.00 no bid no bid no bid
Longway Blvd & Medians of the center of center of
Triangles (3) Longway & south side of Longway from
Dort Hwy to Chavez, including triangle at
Horrigan Dr. & triangle at Chavez.
10 |Excluding triangle at Kearsley Street. $ 440.00 no bid $ 150.00 no bid no bid $ 165.50 no bid no bid
Longway Greenbel Northside of R.T.. Longway from Willow
9.5 |street to Dort Hwy $ 494.00 no bid $ 140.00 no bid nobid | $ 163.50 no bid no bid
McFarlan Park Small park at M. L. King and
0.4 |Saginaw Street $ 42.00 no bid $ 12.00 nobid [$ 7.50 no bid no bid no bid
Hamilton Park Small park at M. L. King anc
0.15 |Fifth Ave $ 4200|$ 550|$% 1200| nobid |[$ 5.75 no bid no bid no bid
Burr Blvd Median from Lippincott to Pingre:
1.5 $ 93.00|$ 17.00($ 19.00[ nobid [$ 16.50 no bid no bid no bid
Beach/Wellington/Churck 3 small triangles at Beach ¢
0.1 |Wellington, Wellington & Church $ 42.00 | $ 550| $ 12.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
12th Street west of Fenton Rd. mow
Cronin Derby Downs from school to woods, and 1-69 to 12th
10 |Street $ 440.00 nobid | $ 160.00| $ 171.00| nobid [$ 16550 | $ 120.00 no bid
12th/Grand Traverse 4 triangles at 12th Street and
0.25 |Grand Traverse $ 42.00| nobid |$ 12.00| nobid |[$ 5.50 no bid no bid $ 6.00
Grand Traverse Triangle Triangle where Grand Traverse ¢
1 Church Street split $ 68.00 nobid |$ 16.00| nobid |$ 8.50 no bid no bid $ 9.00
Kennedy Park 4 Corner of Saginaw St. & Mary — mow bi-
weekly
$ 228.00( nobid | $ 64.00| nobid nobid | $ 75.50 no bid no bid




Aldrich Park 9.2 |Enter off of Hall Street and 2° St. — mow
once a month.
478.00 nobid | $ 145.00| $ 168.00| nobid | $ 161.50 no bid no bid
Grand Traverse Triangle 1 Triangle where Grand Traverse and
Church Street Split
68.00 no bid $ 16.00 no bid 8.50 no bid no bid no bid
Lippincott Blvd. From Blades to Stanford — mow bi-weekl
250.00 nobid | $ 70.00| $ 155.00 [ no bid no bid no bid no bid
North & Southbound From 5" Ave. to Lewis St. and from fencq
Chavez to Chavez — mow bi-weekly. 550.00 | no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
Avondale Cemetary Less |Geneseret and southbound Chavez.
than 1 |Mow every 2-3 weeks. 68.00| nobid |$ 2500| nobid | nobid no bid no bid no bid




