
Property Name Acres Location/Description  AAK 

 Ground 

Control J & M Tree AA Lawn Beck's  Rico 

 3-D 

Lawncare  SRB 

Cemetery

20

City Cemetery is located at Pasadena 

and Linden Rd. Open areas from 

Linden to woods and Pasadena to King 

Par must be mowed 320.00$     no bid 480.00$      1,282.50$  299.00$         300.00$      500.00$        no bid

Flint River Trail

35

Extends from Longway to Carpernter 

Rd. with several areas that run through 

the woods that do not need mowing. All 

open areas to be mowed. 560.00$     no bid 840.00$      570.00$     499.00$         500.00$      875.00$        no bid

Basset Park

18

Located at Ballenger and 

Brownell. Wooded areas to be mowed. 

Does not need weekly mowings. Open 

areas by owner 284.00$     no bid 430.00$      no bid 249.00$         295.00$      450.00$        no bid

Bonner Woods

21

North St. and Ridgeway. Wooded 

areas to be mowed as needed. Does 

not require weekly mowings. Open 

areas by owner. 336.00$     no bid 240.00$      349.00$     325.00$         225.00$      370.00$        no bid
Longway Woods

10

Averill and Whittier Ave. Woods

located in northeastern portion of park. 

Does not need weekly mowings. Open 

areas by owner. 160.00$     152.00$  240.00$      171.00$     154.00$         180.00$      200.00$        120.00$       

Cemetery/Flint River Trail/Wooded Park Areas:


