
Property Name Acres Location/Description  AAK 
 Ground 
Control J & M AA Lawn

 House 
Spouse 

 Jay's Green 
Daze Beck's  W.T. Stevens 

 Carey's 
Lawn Care  Al's Property  SRB 

 Stull's Lawn 
Care 

Whaley Park 72 Located at Franklin Ave. & Utah Ave. 936.00$       no bid 1,296.00$    1,498.00$        954.00$        1,908.00$            1,288.00$    1,120.00$       1,023.00$      3,024.00$        710.00$           1,700.00$     
Broome Park

79 Located near Tuxedo Ave. & Neubert Ave. 1,027.00$    no bid 1,422.00$    1,604.00$        1,046.00$    2,093.50$            1,382.50$    1,225.00$       932.00$         3,318.00$        850.00$           1,800.00$     
Kearsley Park

57 Located Kearsley Park Boulevard & Lewis Street. 741.00$       no bid 1,026.00$    1,191.00$        754.00$        1,510.50$            1,080.00$    885.00$          738.00$         2,394.00$        680.00$           1,250.00$     

Longway Park
23

Located near Averill Ave. & Whittier Ave. (open areas 
only) 345.00$       1,035.00$    575.00$        498.00$           304.00$        360.00$               399.00$        360.00$          297.00$         966.00$           290.00$           500.00$        

Max Brandon Park 20
Perimeter areas only – between the tree line and 
Dupont, M.L. King, Stewart and Pasadena  300.00$       900.00$       1,000.00$    436.00$           264.00$        315.00$               349.00$        325.00$          no bid 840.00$           260.00$           450.00$        

Various parks


