
Northeast

Property Name Acres Location/Description  AAK 
 House 
Spouse J & M AA Lawn

 Ground 
Control 

 3-D 
Lawncare  Beck's 

 W.T. 
Stevens 

 Seymour 
& Sons 

 Brantley 
Dev.  SRB 

Oak Park
8

Parkland and North Street and Baker
130.00$     120.00$ 120.00$   288.00$   120.00$     195.00$    109.00$      $    160.00 320.00$    149.00$    120.00$    

Amos Park
0.25

Small Park at Vernon and Broadway
no bid 8.00$     18.00$     10.00$     6.50$         40.00$      13.00$       25.00$      10.00$      14.00$      no bid

Delaware Park
0.25

Small Park at Vernon and Delaware
no bid 8.00$     18.00$     10.00$     6.50$         40.00$      13.00$       25.00$      10.00$      14.00$      no bid

Wyoming Triangle
0.1

Triangle at Wyoming and Olive
no bid 7.00$     18.00$     10.00$     6.50$         20.00$      11.00$       25.00$      4.00$        14.00$      no bid

Colorado Triangle 0.1 Triangle at Colorado and Lewis St. no bid 7.00$     18.00$     10.00$     6.50$         20.00$      11.00$       25.00$      4.00$        14.00$      no bid
Upriver Park (Riverside)

5.5
Parkland at Webster and Jewell 
excluding wooded area 110.00$     75.00$   74.00$     165.00$   75.00$       125.00$    69.00$       115.00$    220.00$    99.00$      no bid

Bundy Park 1 Bundy Street and end of cul-de-sac no bid 18.00$   18.00$     10.00$     18.00$       40.00$      16.00$       28.00$      30.00$      24.00$      no bid
W. Blvd Park

2
Park at W. Blvd Dr. near Dort Hwy

no bid 34.00$   33.00$     72.00$     32.00$       80.00$      29.00$       50.00$      70.00$      47.00$      no bid
James P. Cole Blvd

5

Median in middle of J. P. Cole Blvd from 
Stewart to W. Blvd Dr. 

110.00$     75.00$   72.00$     140.00$   75.00$       125.00$    69.00$       115.00$    190.00$    14.00$      no bid
Lewis Street Triangle

0.1
Large Triangle at Lewis Street and Leith

no bid 7.00$     18.00$     10.00$     6.50$         20.00$      13.00$       25.00$      4.00$        14.00$      no bid
Lewis Street Park

3
Parkland along river at Lewis and Leith

90.00$       45.00$   40.00$     90.00$     45.00$       90.00$      39.00$       68.00$      90.00$      49.00$      no bid
Riverside Triangle

2
Triangle at Riverside and Hamilton

60.00$       34.00$   30.00$     72.00$     32.00$       40.00$      29.00$       52.00$      80.00$      49.00$      no bid
James P. Cole Triangle

0.1
Small park at M. L. King and
Fifth Ave no bid 7.00$     18.00$     10.00$     6.50$         20.00$      13.00$       25.00$      6.00$        14.00$      no bid

Hamilton Triangle
2

Median from Lippincott to Pingree
70.00$       34.00$   33.00$     72.00$     32.00$       40.00$      29.00$       52.00$      80.00$      49.00$      no bid

Kearsley Park Triangle
0.1

Triangle at Garfield and J. P. Cole
no bid 7.00$     18.00$     10.00$     6.50$         20.00$      14.00$       25.00$      6.00$        14.00$      no bid

Chavez/Kearsley Park 
Triangle 0.1

Triangle at NB Chavez and Kearsley 
Park Blvd no bid 7.00$     18.00$     10.00$     6.50$         20.00$      13.00$       25.00$      6.00$        14.00$      no bid

Davison/Lewis Triangle
0.1

Triangle at Lewis and Davison Rd
no bid 7.00$     18.00$     10.00$     6.50$         20.00$      11.00$       25.00$      6.00$        14.00$      no bid

Broadway Blvd
3

Median of Broadway from Olive to 
Franklin 90.00$       47.00$   43.00$     85.00$     40.00$       75.00$      38.00$       75.00$      120.00$    49.00$      no bid

North Street Blvd
1.5

Median of North St. Blvd from
Hamilton to Leith 45.00$       27.00$   26.00$     65.00$     27.00$       60.00$      24.00$       37.00$      60.00$      34.00$      no bid

Dort/Leith
1

Triangle at Dort Hwy and Leith Street
40.00$       18.00$   18.00$     50.00$     18.00$       40.00$      14.00$       25.00$      40.00$      29.00$      no bid

Polk Park 0.25
Small triangle at Pitkin Ave. and 
Earlmoor Blvd. no bid 9.00$     18.00$     10.00$     6.50$         20.00$      13.00$       25.00$      10.00$      14.00$      no bid
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