Cemetery/Flint River Trall/Wooded Park Areas:

Property Name

Acres

Location/Description

AAK

Ground
Control

J& MTree

AA Lawn

House
Spouse

Beck's

W.T.
Stevens

3-D
Lawncare

Seymour &
Sons

Brantley

SRB

Cemetery

20

City Cemetery is located at Pasadena
and Linden Rd. Open areas from
Linden to woods and Pasadena to King
Par must be mowed

299.00

$ 300.00

$ 360.00

$ 555.00

$ 330.00

299.00

$ 400.00

$ 500.00

$  600.00

$  325.00

$

320.00

Flint River Trail

35

Extends from Longway to Carpernter
Rd. with several areas that run through
the woods that do not need mowing. All
open areas to be mowed.

523.00

$510.00

$ 520.00

$ 585.00

$ 560.00

499.00

$ 700.00

$ 725.00

$ 1,050.00

$  550.00

no bid

Basset Park

18

Located at Ballenger and

Brownell. Wooded areas to be mowed.
Does not need weekly mowings. Open
areas by owner

268.00

$ 280.00

$ 265.00

$ 445.00

$ 290.00

249.00

$ 360.00

$ 440.00

$  720.00

$  300.00

no bid

Bonner Woods

10

North St. and Ridgeway. Wooded
areas to be mowed as needed. Does
not require weekly mowings. Open
areas by owner.

164.00

$ 155.00

$ 165.00

$ 345.00

$ 175.00

154.00

$ 250.00

$ 240.00

$  400.00

$ 175.00

no bid

Longway Woods

10

Averill and Whittier Ave. Woods
located in northeastern portion of park.
Does not need weekly mowings. Open
areas by owner.

164.00

$ 165.00

$ 165.00

$ 345.00

$ 175.00

154.00

$ 250.00

$ 240.00

$  400.00

$ 175.00

no bid




Cemetery/Flint River Trail/Wooded Park Areas:

Elam Dan's Brinks
Property Name Acres |Location/Description Service IMA | J& M Tree | AA Lawn | Grounds [Lawn Beck's | W.T. Stevens | Axis Lawn | Lawn Care
Cemetery
City Cemetery is located at Pasadena
and Linden Rd. Open areas from
Linden to woods and Pasadena to King
20 Par must be mowed no bid no bid 700 394 700 550 500 420 750 500
Flint River Trail Extends from Longway to Carpernter
Rd. with several areas that run through
the woods that do not need mowing. All
35 open areas to be mowed. no bid 645 1225 694 700 no bid 875 735 1400 775
Basset Park Located at Ballenger and
Brownell. Wooded areas to be mowed.
Does not need weekly mowings. Open
18 areas by owner no bid no bid 600 356 600 no bhid 450 378 360 700
Bonner Woods
North St. and Ridgeway. Wooded
areas to be mowed as needed. Does
not require weekly mowings. Open
10 areas by owner. no bid no bid 350 218 400 no bid 250 236 no bid 400
Longway Woods
Averill and Whittier Ave. Woods
located in northeastern portion of park.
Does not need weekly mowings. Open
10 areas by owner. no bid 190 350 217 400 250 250 236 no bid 300
Total Acres 93 Total for all Properties 3225 1879 1900 800 2325 2005 2675
Notes
Number of
Properties
Awarded/Amount 1/$225 4/$1685
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