South

United Ground No Mo
Property Name Acres |Location/Description Lawnscape | Control J&M AA Lawn | Tears SRB IA.F.
Beecher Triangle 0.5 |Triangle at Beecher and Ballenger Hwy.| $ 4200 $ 800|$% 2000| nobid [$ 7.50 no bid $ 9.00
Fenton/AthertonTriangle Triangle at Fenton and Atherton Rd
0.1 $ 4200|$% 575[% 20.00 nobid |$ 5.00 no bid $ 5.50
McKinley Park Park area at Collingwood and Pier,
north to ballfield, excluding wooded
8 |area $ 416.00 | nobid |$ 120.00 | $ 142.50 | no bid no bid $ 100.00
Cummings Park Small park area along Orville St
4 $ 228.00 | nobid [$ 64.00 no bid nobid |$ 45.00 ]| $ 40.00
Mobley Park Triangular park at corner of Miller and
2 |Court Street (divided by residential St) | $ 124.00 | nobid |$ 32.00| % 51.00|$ 19.50 no bid no bid
Hammerburg Triangle Small triangle at Hammerburg and
0.2 |Miller Road. $ 4200|$% 575[% 20.00 nobid |$ 5.50 no bid no bid
Chicago Triangles (3) 3 triangles on Chicago Blvd, 1 at
0.5 |Barney, 1 at Knight, and one at Stocker | $ 4200 % 9.00| % 20.00 no bid $ 975 no bid no bid
Crocker Park parkland north of Thread Lake and
south of Lippincott running from
4 [Maybury to Dwight $ 228.00 nobid |$ 64.00 no bid no bid $ 40.00 no bid
Victoria Triangle Triangle at Victoria and Grand Traverse
0.1 $ 4200|$% 575[% 20.00 nobid |$ 5.00 no bid $ 5.50
Mott Park Triangles (3) Bagley and Chevrolet, Marquette and
0.75 |Weller, Marquette and Dougherty $ 51.00 nobid |$ 20.00 no bid $ 9.75 no bid no bid
Perry Street Triangles (2) Woodbridge and Perry, Cartier and
0.75 |Perry $ 51.00 nobid |$ 20.00 no bid $ 9.75 no bid no bid
Cadillac Triangle Triangle at Cadillac and Dupont
0.1 $ 4200 % 575[% 20.00 nobid [$ 575 no bid no bid
Linsey Blvd Median along Linsey from Saginaw
1 [Streetto 1-475 $ 68.00 | $§ 12.00| % 20.00 nobid [$ 11.50 no bid $ 12.00
Omega Triangle Triangle at Ogema and Dell
0.1 $ 4200 % 575[% 20.00 nobid |$ 5.00 no bid $ 5.50
Saginaw/Atherton
Triangle Traingle at Saginaw and Atherton Rd
0.1 $ 4200|$% 575[% 20.00 nobid |$ 5.00 no bid $ 5.50
Atherton East Park Park area at Farley and Chambers,
10 |excluding school property $ 440.00 nobid | $ 160.00 no bid no bid $ 120.00 no bid
Atherton Triangle 0.1 |Triangle at Atherton and Vanslyke $ 4200 % 575[% 20.00 no bid $ 5.75 no bid $ 5.50
Ramsey Triangle Triangle at Ramsey and Colfax
0.1 $ 4200|$% 575[% 20.00 nobid [$ 575 no bid no bid
Dupont Blvd Median from Chevrolet to Flushing Rd
2 $ 124.00 | $ 25.00|$ 32.00 nobid [$ 24.50 no bid no bid
Chevrolet Ave Medain from Mackin Rd to Dupont
4 $ 228.00 no bid $ 64.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid
S. Saginaw St. Blvd Median from 12th St. to 14th Street
0.75 $ 51.00 | nobid |[$ 2000]| nobid |[$ 850| nobid |$§ 9.00




Connected to Freeman School (Ogema

Farnumwood Park 11 |& Atherton Rds. $ 484.00 no bid $ 190.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid
Park on Pengelly; south of Atherton,
north of Hemphill, east of Saginaw St.

Windiate Park 5 [- mow bi-weekly. $ 285.00 nobid | $ 80.00 no bid no bid $ 75.00 no bid




