Cemetery/Flint River Trail/Wooded Park Areas:

Property Name

Acres

Location/Description

United
Lawnscape

J & M Tree

AA Lawn

Brantley
Develop.

Cemetery

77.5

City Cemetery is located at Pasadena
and Linden Rd. Open areas from
Linden to woods and Pasadena to King
Par must be mowed

$3,410.00

$ 1,240.00

$1,368.00

332.00

Flint River Trail

35

Extends from Longway to Carpernter
Rd. with several areas that run through
the woods that do not need mowing. Al
open areas to be mowed.

$ 1,540.00

$ 560.00

no bid

574.50

Bonner Park
(Including woods)

21

Bonner Park is located at North St. and
Ridgeway Ave. Wooded area located
in the eastern portion of the park
requires mowing with proper
equipment. Open areas will be mowed
by owner. This area will require bi-
weekly mowings.

$ 924.00

$ 330.00

no bid

349.50

Longway Woods

10

Averill and Whittier Ave. Woods
located in northeastern portion of park.
Does not need weekly mowings. Open
areas by owner.

$ 440.00

$ 160.00

no bid

163.50

Martin Park

3.6

Ruth & Saginaw St. — mow once a montH

$ 205.00

$ 58.00

no bid

no bid

Eldorado Vista Park

6.8

Between Stevenson and Raskob —

mow bi-weekly.

$ 354.00

$ 108.00

no bid

no bid




